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Arduino Workshop, 2nd Edition is the ultimate guide to DIY electronics
projects with Arduino UNO and Genuino 101. This book will teach you
everything you need to know to get started with Arduino, from the basics of
electronics to advanced programming techniques.

Arduino is an open-source electronics platform based on easy-to-use
hardware and software. It's perfect for beginners and experienced makers
alike, and it can be used to create a wide variety of DIY electronics
projects, including robots, weather stations, and home automation systems.

This book is a comprehensive guide to Arduino, and it covers everything
you need to know to get started. It starts with the basics of electronics, and
then it goes on to cover more advanced topics, such as programming,
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interfacing with sensors and actuators, and building your own Arduino
projects.

What's New in the 2nd Edition?

The 2nd edition of Arduino Workshop has been updated to include the
latest Arduino hardware and software. It also includes new projects and
tutorials, and it has been expanded to cover more advanced topics.

Here are some of the new features in the 2nd edition:

Coverage of the latest Arduino hardware and software, including the
Arduino UNO and Genuino 101

New projects and tutorials, including projects that use sensors,
actuators, and wireless communication

Expanded coverage of advanced topics, such as programming,
interfacing with sensors and actuators, and building your own Arduino
projects

Who is this Book For?

Arduino Workshop, 2nd Edition is perfect for anyone who wants to learn
more about Arduino and DIY electronics. It's ideal for beginners who are
just getting started, and it's also a valuable resource for experienced
makers who want to learn more about advanced topics.

If you're interested in learning more about Arduino, then Arduino Workshop,
2nd Edition is the book for you.

About the Author



John Boxall is a lifelong maker and educator. He has been working with
Arduino since 2011, and he has taught Arduino workshops to thousands of
people. John is also the author of several other books on Arduino and
electronics.
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